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and more. The present invention relates to ceramic

components, and more particularly, to a wound ceramic
component having high porosity and an integral, integral

tubular metal core. In U.S. Pat. No. 4,614,871, which is hereby
incorporated by reference, novel ceramic components are

described and claimed which have porosity including a self-
supporting hollow tube having two ends and an integral,

integral tubular metal core. These components are shown in
FIGS. 1 and 2 of the '871 patent and include a metal core 2

which generally has a hollow, substantially cylindrical shape.
The hollow ceramic tube is generally wound such that its
longitudinal axis is substantially parallel to the axis of the
metal core. The number of windings is selected so that the

ratio of longitudinal to circumferential length is substantially
larger for the ceramic tube than for the metal core, such that
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the metal core partially and radially supports the wound
ceramic tube at the end portions. The hollow tube portion of
the component is filled with a ceramic paste, which is either
dispersed in a liquid binder or unbound, to form the desired
ceramic component. The ceramic component is thereafter
heated to a temperature above the softening point of the

metal core and below the ceramic fusing temperature to cause
shrinkage of the ceramic in the longitudinal direction. This

causes the ceramic paste in the interior to be forced outwards
towards the metal core, as shown in FIG. 2. The components of
FIGS. 1 and 2 of the '871 patent thus have the ability to exhibit

tensile, flexural, and fatigue strength, as well as chemical,
thermal, and corrosion resistance. The ceramic components of
the '871 patent thus have a number of advantages over other

ceramic components. For example, the components are
fabricated from a single metallic component having an integral

ceramic tube
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